

LAW OFFICES OF
 ROBISON, BELAUSTEGUI, SHARP AND LOW
 A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION

RECEIVED
 NOV 16 2016
 F180A4

71 WASHINGTON STREET
 RENO, NEVADA 89503
 TAX ID#88-0173763
 TELEPHONE (775) 329-3151
 FACSIMILE (775) 329-7941

T29006734A

FY 17
 PVE 580-0000 1541928
 224 580 0000 3920 04 7065
 CAT GL
 \$ 16,847.22 DATE 12/5/16
 DE 12/5/16 PEND 3 12/5/16 KRS
 PEND 4 12/5/16 KRS
 WARRANT# 3232001
 WARRANT DATE 12/5/16
 BSR DATE 12/9/16

Page: 1
 10/31/2016
 1363-001M
 4

ACCOUNT NO:
 STATEMENT NO:



ANCE

\$33,914.83

FEES THROUGH 10/25/2016

			HOURS	
09/27/2016	TMS	Finish draft argument portion of MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (4); edit (3.75); research re filing motion to exceed page limits (0.25)	8.00	2,240.00
	KRR	Work with Therese on drafting rough draft of motion for summary judgment. Work on affidavits for PUCN Commissioners and lawyers. Organize and assemble exhibits for motion.	2.90	1,160.00
09/28/2016	KRR	Continue to work on motion for summary judgment, affidavits, and exhibits.	1.60	640.00
09/29/2016	JS	Conference with Kent Robison. Locate and contact potential experts. Attend telephone conference with Kent Robison and expert (Hancock).	0.80	96.00
	TMS	Incorporate KRR edits into MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT and edit to make page limit	1.20	336.00
	KRR	Telephone conference with potential expert Jeff Hancock. Receive, review Hancock's proposed fee agreement. Redraft fee agreement. Assemble documents to be sent to Professor Hancock regarding issues. Work on affidavits and finalize latest draft of motion for summary judgment.	2.20	880.00
09/30/2016	TMS	Incorporate client edits into motion (0.6); edit all draft declarations and affidavits (1); citation check motion (1.5); research re need to file an answer in light of motion work (0.5); review amended complaint (0.4)	4.00	1,120.00
	KRR	Work on declarations. Telephone conference with Tanner. Receive, review and implemented Tanner's suggested changes on affidavits and declarations. Receive and review amended complaint.	1.90	760.00
10/03/2016	KRR	Reviewed, evaluated and analyzed Amended Complaint filed by Switch. Conference with client regarding strategy going forward. Implemented clients changes into declarations.	3.30	1,320.00

Contracts
 BT

Carolyn Tanner

Page: 2
10/31/2016
ACCOUNT NO: 1363-001M
STATEMENT NO: 4

Switch, Ltd. vs.

			HOURS	
	TMS	Call with client (0.3); research re Anti-SLAPP in federal court (0.7); email KRR and client re same (0.2)	1.20	336.00
10/04/2016	TMS	Return Hayley Williamson's call (0.2); call with Hayley Williamson and Garrett Weir (0.6)	0.80	224.00
10/05/2016	JS	Conference with Kent Robison and Therese Shanks. Locate and prepare documents/information for Kent Robison.	0.50	60.00
	TMS	Meet with KRR re issues (0.4); begin converting MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT into a Rule 12 motion to dismiss (0.4)	0.80	224.00
	KRR	Continue review of amended complaint. Strategy conference regarding need to file anti-SLAPP in light of new allegations. Start work on new motion to dismiss based on immunity grounds. Telephone conference with Jeff Hancock regarding amended complaint and need for revised engagement letter.	2.40	960.00
10/07/2016	TMS	Call with client (0.6); continue to convert motion for summary judgment into motion to dismiss (1.4); analyze what arguments need to be raised in motion to dismiss (1)	3.00	840.00
10/10/2016	TMS	Finish Converting motion for summary judgment into motion to dismiss (2.4); edit motion (1); draft motion to take judicial notice (1)	4.40	1,232.00
	KRR	Work on motion to dismiss. Draft introduction. Proof Therese's draft.	1.90	760.00
10/11/2016	TMS	Research re social media discovery	1.50	420.00
	KRR	Continue to work on motion to dismiss. Telephone conference with Nick Santaro regarding defenses common to Nevada Energy. Report on status. Status letter to Stephanie Mullen with enclosures.	1.90	760.00
10/12/2016	TMS	Further research re experts specializing in social media ediscovery	1.50	420.00
	KRR	Telephone conference with Nick Santaro regarding motion to dismiss. Review docket to confirm that Nevada Energy has been served and check on status of service on commissioners. Process invoice to Stephanie Mullen. Research regarding anti-SLAPP motion on admitted complaint. Continue to search for experts regarding social media platform and retrieval of information.	1.90	760.00
10/13/2016	TMS	Call with PUCN counsel re Barrick (0.2); edit motion to dismiss re earlier Barrick opinion (0.5); edit request for judicial notice to include new exhibit (0.5); pull exhibits for final (0.2)	1.40	392.00
	KRR	Made finishing touches on motion to dismiss. Telephone conference with Nick Santaro. Work on notice of ongoing compliance with preliminary injunction.	1.10	440.00
10/14/2016	TMS	Edit motion (0.2); review what other items need to be briefed or addressed (0.4)	0.60	168.00
10/18/2016	JF	Draft Certificate of Interested Parties.	0.25	25.00
		FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED	51.05	16,573.00

Carolyn Tanner

Switch, Ltd. vs.

Page: 3
10/31/2016
ACCOUNT NO: 1363-001M
STATEMENT NO: 4

EXPENSES THROUGH 10/25/2016

10/17/2016	Check issued to Thomson Reuters - West Legal research.	<u>274.22</u>
	TOTAL EXPENSES	274.22
	TOTAL CURRENT WORK	16,847.22
	<i>BALANCE DUE</i>	<u>\$50,762.05</u>

***We accept MasterCard and Visa as payment on your bill. Please contact our
billing department for payment processing.***
